



THE COUNTY OF GALVESTON

RUFUS G. CROWDER, CPPO, CPPB
PURCHASING AGENT

COUNTY COURTHOUSE
722 Moody (21st Street)
Fifth (5th) Floor
GALVESTON, TEXAS 77550
(409) 770-5371

December 12, 2022

Victoria Espino
Martin Asphalt Company
3 Riverway, Suite 400
Houston, TX 77056

Re: ITB #B232002, Asphalt, Oils & Emulsions
Contract #CM23202

Dear Mrs. Espino,

At our special meeting of the Galveston County Commissioners' Court on December 12, 2022, your company was awarded the bid for ITB #B232002, Asphalt, Oils, & Emulsions. Your company was awarded the following line items:

- line items 0013, 0014, 0015, and 0016.

Contract dates are January 24, 2023 – January 23, 2024. A fully executed contract will be sent to you once all signatures have been obtained.


Invoices are to be sent to the following address:

Galveston County Auditor's Office
P.O. Box 1418
Galveston, Texas 77553

If you have any questions, please feel free to call.

CONGRATULATIONS and we look forward to doing business with your company!

Sincerely,


Rufus G. Crowder, CPPO CPPB
Purchasing Agent
County of Galveston County

B232002 Asphalt, Oils Emulsions

Item No	Product Code	Description	CURRENT:			BID:			Percent Change	BID: Martin Asphalt	Percent Change	BID: Ergon Asphalt	Percent Change
			Cleveland Asphalt	Martin Asphalt	Cleveland Asphalt	Cleveland Asphalt	Ergon Asphalt						
0001	74508	SS-1 FOB SANTA FE		\$2.10	\$2.80			33%	\$2.89	38%	\$3.50	950%	
0002	74508	CRS-2 FOB SANTA FE		\$2.10	\$2.80			33%	\$2.89	38%	\$3.33	899%	
0003	74508	EAP+T FOB SANTA FE	\$2.25		\$2.80			24%	\$2.89	28%	No Bid		
0004	74508	DROP TANKER FEE SANTA FE	\$750.00		\$900.00			20%	\$100.00	-87%	No Bid		
0005	74508	SS-1 FOB SAN LEON		\$2.10	\$2.80			33%	\$2.89	38%	\$3.50	950%	
0006	74508	CRS-2 FOB SAN LEON		\$2.10	\$2.80			33%	\$2.89	38%	\$3.33	899%	
0007	74508	EAP+T FOB SAN LEON	\$2.25		\$2.80			24%	\$2.89	28%	No bid		
0008	74508	DROP TANKER FEE SAN LEON	\$750.00		\$900.00			20%	\$100.00	-87%	No Bid		
0009	74508	SS-1 FOB CRYSTAL BEACH		\$2.11	\$2.80			33%	\$2.90	37%	\$3.50	970%	
0010	74508	CRS-2 FOB CRYSTAL BEACH		\$2.11	\$2.80			33%	\$2.90	37%	\$3.33	918%	
0011	74508	EAP+T FOB CRYSTAL BEACH	\$2.25		\$2.80			24%	\$2.90	29%	No Bid		
0012	74508	DROP TANKER FEE CRYSTAL BEACH	\$750.00		\$900.00			20%	\$100.00	-87%	No Bid		
0013	74508	SS-1 FOB PLANT SITE		\$2.00	\$2.65			39%	\$2.75	38%	\$3.20	885%	
0014	74508	CRS-2 FOB PLANT SITE		\$2.00	\$2.65			33%	\$2.75	36%	\$3.00	823%	
0015	74508	EAP+T FOB PLANT SITE	\$2.10		\$2.65			26%	\$2.75	31%	No Bid		
0016	74508	CRS2-P FOB PLANTSITE			\$3.15				\$3.30		\$3.45		
0017	74508	CATIONIC BASE STABILIZATION ASPHALT EMULSION FOB SANTA FE CSS-1			\$2.80				\$2.89		\$3.38		
0018	74508	CATIONIC BASE STABILIZATION ASPHALT EMULSION FOB SAN LEON CSS-1			\$2.80				\$2.89		\$3.38		
0019	74508	CATIONIC BASE STABILIZATION ASPHALT EMULSION FOB CRYSTAL BEACH CSS-1			\$2.80				\$2.90		\$3.38		

Cleveland	
Cationic Base Stabilization Asphalt Emulsion: Other Options	
CSS-1 Dilute 50/50	\$1.60 gal
CSS-1H	\$2.90 gal
CSS-1H Dilute 50/50	\$1.68 gal
Diluted material can not be returned for credit. (Product 50% / H2O 50%) Dilution is	